
                    

                                

                     ADDENDA         ONE                 

                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                       

                                            BID TABULATION FOR                                                 2026 CHEMICALS FOR GOLF COURSES                                                                                                                            

 

                                            BIDS OPENED ON                                                  MONDAY, DECEMBER 22, 2025 AT 3:00 P.M.                                                                                                                        

                                           
         

COMPANY 
           

HARRELL’S, LLC 
 
REGAL CHEMICAL 

 
SIMPLOT AB RETAIL, 

INC. 

    

BB/CC 
 

BB 

 

BB 

 

BB 

    

ADD ACK. 
 

1 

 

1 

 

1 

    

ITEM 1 
 

$35.25 

 

$41.50 

 

$39.75 

    

ITEM 2 
 

$30.25 

 

NO BID 

 

$29.75 

    

ITEM 3 
 

$19.00 

 

$25.25 

 

$23.75 

    

ITEM 4 
 

NO BID 

 

$68.00 

 

NO BID 

    

ITEM 5 
 

NO BID 

 

$57.50 

 

NO BID 

    

ITEM 6 

 

NO BID 

 

$65.50 

 

NO BID 

    

ITEM 7 
 

$21.75 

 

$28.25 

 

$26.20 

    

ITEM 8 
 

$51.00  

 

$55.50 

 

NO BID 

    

ITEM 9 
 

$56.80  

 

$63.00 

 

NO BID 

    



ITEM 10 
 

NO BID 

 

$74.00 

 

NO BID 

    

ITEM 11 
 

NO BID 

 

$82.00 

 

NO BID 

    

ITEM 12 
 

NO BID 

 

$89.00 

 

NO BID 

    

ITEM 13 
 

NO BID 

 

$35.00 

 

NO BID 

    

ITEM 14 
 

$384.56  

 

$384.56  

 

$384.56  

    

ITEM 15 
 

$1,267.00  

 

$1,267.00  

 

$1,267.00  

    

ITEM 16 
 

$699.00 

 

$435.00 

 

$699.00 

    

ITEM 17 
 

$922.50  

 

NO BID 

 

$922.50  

    

ITEM 18 

 

$1,946.30 

 

 

$1,946.30 

 

$1,946.30 

    

ITEM 19 
 

$811.25 

 

$811.25 

 

$811.25 

    

ITEM 20 
 

$77.15 

 

$80.00  

 

$69.00 

    

ITEM 21 
 

$727.32 

 

$727.32 

 

$727.32 

    

ITEM 22 

 

$367.00 

 

 

$367.00  

 

$367.00 

    

ITEM 23 
 

$103.04 

 

$110.00  

 

$108.00 

    



ITEM 24 
 

$118.35  

 

$275.00  

 

$190.00  

    

ITEM 25 
 

$148.32 

 

$147.70 

 

$148.55 

    

ITEM 26 
 

$739.25  

 

NO BID 

 

$775  

    

ITEM 27 
 

$330.79 

 

$330.79 

 

$330.79 

    

ITEM 28 
 

$70.73 

 

$85.00 

 

$83.00 

    

ITEM 29 
 

$371.29 

  

NO BID 

 

$392.00 

    

ITEM 30 
 

$1,865.42 

 

$1,865.42 

 

$1,865.42 

    

ITEM 31 
 

NO BID 

 

NO BID 

 

NO BID 

    

ITEM 32 
 

$23.64  

 

$27.00 

 

$19.25  

    

ITEM 33 
 

$30.59  

 

$28.50 

 

$21.00  

    

ITEM 34 
 

$16.11 

 

NO BID 

 

$19.50 

    

ITEM 35 
 

$14.02 

 

NO BID 

 

$17.75 

    

ITEM 36 
 

$408.00 

 

$408.00 

 

$408.00 

    

ITEM 37 
 

$40.10  

 

$55.50  

 

$48.00 

    



ITEM 38 

 

$1,296.90 

 

 

$1,296.90 

 

$1,296.90 

    

ITEM 39 
 

$20.00  

 

$20.00  

 

$20.00 

    

 


