BID TABULATION FOR

2026 Wastewater Stock Material

BID # _ 260085

ADDENDA

NONE

BIDS OPENED ON

THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 5, 2026 AT 11:00 A.M.

Company Ralph’s of Lafayette Lafayette Winwater Works Ferguson Enterprises, LLC
BB/CC CcC BB BB

LA PREF No No No
GROUP 1 - PIPE

ITEM 1 (31400003) NO BID $7,654.80 $6,736.80
ITEM 2 (31400005) NO BID $8,442.00 $7,425.60
ITEM 3 (31400049) NO BID $3,696.00 $3,242.40
GROUP 2 -MANHOLES

ITEM 4 (30340004) NO BID $4,536.00 $4,395.00
ITEM 5 (31340002) NO BID $1,795.00 $1,738.00
ITEM 6 (31340006) NO BID $91,960.00 $8,100.00
ITEM 7 (31340024) NO BID $2,887.50 $2,795.75
ITEM 8 (31340039) NO BID $4,039.50 $3,910.80
ITEM 9 (31340040) NO BID $5,064.00 $4,903.50
ITEM 10 (31340041) NO BID $6,000.00 $5,835.00
ITEM 11 (31340042) NO BID $8,077.50 $7,821.00
ITEM 12 (31340043) NO BID $12,114.00 $11,730.00
ITEM 13 (31400059) NO BID $150.00 $59.10




Company Ralph’s of Lafayette Lafayette Winwater Works Ferguson Enterprises, LLC
BB/CC CC BB BB

LA PREF No No No
ITEM 14 (31400060) NO BID $400.00 $204.60
ITEM 15 (31400061) NO BID $420.00 $203.40
GROUP 3-PVC FITTINGS

ITEM 16 (31400006) NO BID $1,717.50 $1,623.75
ITEM 17 (31400007) NO BID $2,210.00 $2,100.00
ITEM 18 (31400008) NO BID $2,430.00 $2,297.50
ITEM 19 (31400009) NO BID $3,325.00 $1,800.00
ITEM 20 (31400018) NO BID $162.50 $140.00
ITEM 21 (31400019) NO BID $930.00 $860.00
ITEM 22 (31400020) NO BID $975.00 $912.00
ITEM 23 (31400021) NO BID $450.00 $339.00
ITEM 24 (31400023) NO BID $760.00 $676.00
ITEM 25 (31400047) NO BID $1,157.50 $1,083.00
ITEM 26 (31400090) NO BID $1,998.00 $2,094.60
ITEM 27 (31400096) NO BID $2,592.00 $2,400.00
ITEM 28 (31810001) NO BID $262.50 $210.00
ITEM 29 (31820001) NO BID $487.50 $431.25
ITEM 30 (31830001) NO BID $210.00 $184.00
ITEM 31 (31840001) NO BID $260.00 $228.00
ITEM 32 (31860001) NO BID $217.50 $192.50




Company Ralph’s of Lafayette Lafayette Winwater Works Ferguson Enterprises, LLC
BB/CC CC BB BB

LA PREF No No No
ITEM 33 (31910001) NO BID $375.00 $261.00
ITEM 34 (31910003) NO BID $882.00 $802.50
GROUP 4 — COUPLNGS (RUBBER REPAIR)

ITEM 35 (31504041) NO BID $1,300.00 $980.00
ITEM 36 (31504042) NO BID $225.00 $147.00
ITEM 37 (31506041) NO BID $487.50 $921.75
ITEM 38 (31506042) NO BID $225.00 $368.70
ITEM 39 (31506044) NO BID $290.00 $251.60
ITEM 40 (31506061) NO BID $2,310.00 $1,570.50
ITEM 41 (31506062) NO BID $3,080.00 $2,094.00
ITEM 42 (31508081) NO BID $1,140.00 $966.00
ITEM 43 (31508082) NO BID $2,850.00 $2,415.00
ITEM 44 (31508085) NO BID $333.00 $261.00
ITEM 45 (31510102) NO BID $570.00 $483.80
ITEM 46 (31608061) NO BID $350.00 $362.00
ITEM 47 (31608064) NO BID $525.00 $563.70
GROUP 5 - PE PIPE

ITEM 48 (31400099) NO BID $970.00 $1,462.00
ITEM 49 (31400100) NO BID $1,700.00 $2,016.00

GROUP 6 — REPAIR CLAMPS




Company Ralph’s of Lafayette Lafayette Winwater Works Ferguson Enterprises, LLC
BB/CC CC BB BB

LA PREF No No No
ITEM 50 (31504004) NO BID $973.50 $2,030.00
ITEM 51 (31504006) NO BID $1,071.00 $2,198.50
ITEM 52 (31504008) NO BID $1,201.50 $2,497.50
ITEM 53 (31504010) NO BID $2,046.25 $3,857.00
ITEM 54 (31504012) NO BID $2,292.50 $4,379.00
GROUP 7 - BACKWATER VALVES

ITEM 55 (32100204) NO BID NO BID $149.50
ITEM 56 (32100206) NO BID NO BID $5555.00
GROUP 8 - ELECTRONICS

ITEM 57 (33000000) $2,357.70 NO BID NO BID
ITEM 58 (33000101) $82.14 NO BID NO BID
ITEM 59 (33000400) $942.75 NO BID NO BID
ITEM 60 (33000401) $684.50 NO BID NO BID
ITEM 61 (33000600) $5,961.00 NO BID NO BID
ITEM 62 (33002071) NO BID NO BID NO BID
ITEM 63 (33003050) $2,898.00 NO BID NO BID
ITEM 64 (33003055) $5,701.00 NO BID NO BID
ITMEM 65 (33003060) $5,468.10 NO BID NO BID
ITEM 66 (33005200) NO BID NO BID NO BID
ITEM 67 (33005201) $348.84 NO BID NO BID




Company Ralph’s of Lafayette Lafayette Winwater Works Ferguson Enterprises, LLC
BB/CC CC BB BB

LA PREF No No No

ITEM 68 (33005304) $3,428.70 NO BID NO BID
ITEM 69 (3305405) $1,973.40 NO BID NO BID
GROUP 9 - FLOATS

ITEM 70 (33005305) NO BID NO BID NO BID
ITEM 71 (3305309) NO BID NO BID NO BID
GROUP 10 - MISCELLANEQOUS

ITEM 72 (31339003) NO BID $21,600.00 $21,600.00
ITEM 73 (31700001) NO BID $1,700.00 $2,090.00
ITEM 74 (31700004) NO BID $1,540.00 $490.00
ITEM 75 (31800001) NO BID $400.00 $388.00
ITEM 76 (32100214) NO BID $1,275.00 $487.50
ITEM 77 (32100216) NO BID $3,000.00 $1,150.00




